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Initially, 210 of 1,220 individuals who participated a cohort of a
previous study involving whole-genome sequencing, were
selected per the following inclusion criteria: adults (age > 20
years), hypercholesterolemia (total cholesterol > 250 mg/dl; LDL
cholesterol > 180 mg/dl), having a past medical history, and
wishing for results of genetic analysis to be shared with them.
Finally, 36 out of 210 individuals consented to participate in the
study and 29 valid responses were hence the final subjects
(Table.1). We administered questionnaires before and after a
lecture on basic genetics (Regarding DNA, chromosome, mode
of inheritance etc.) and assessed their understanding using a

McNemar’s test and a Wilcoxon signed rank test.
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The present results suggest that genetic education is effective 
and important for accurate understanding of genetic disorders. 

Among individuals with genetic disorders who undergo genetic
analysis, it is necessary to share the results with individuals for
effective prevention and treatment. However, few studies have
been conducted on sharing the results of genetic analysis in the
general population with limited findings regarding this practice.
Therefore, the present pilot study aimed to investigate the
sharing of results of genetic analysis for familial
hypercholesterolemia (FH) and to investigate the rate of literacy
transition after a lecture on basic genetics.

The total scores of correct answers to questions regarding basic 
genetics were significantly higher after than before the lecture 
(p < 0.001) (Table 2).

Fig. 1 Views of the genetic lecture


